From: David Scheim [davids@naxs.net]�Sent: Friday, April 16, 2004 2:02 PM�To: Gary Huff�Cc: Kathleen Dooley; Adele Schirmer; tsherman@vt.edu; Al Leighton (Al Leighton); Frances Parsons (Frances Parsons); J. B. Jones Jr. (JB Jones); Joyce Lewis (Joyce Lewis); Roger Hedgepeth (Roger Hedgepeth); Ron Rordam (Ron Rordam); Ken Anderson�Subject: RE: contracts for engineering support for TCB sewer construction





Gary,


 


Thank you for your reply.


 


As I stated to Town Council the evening of April 13 in response, I never claimed that the engineering agreement you signed May 21, 1999 committed or appropriated funds.  My two concerns have been and remain:


 


1) That you signed this agreement for engineering services to design and construct phase I of the 30-year-old TCB gravity sewer plan ten days after Town Council voted to direct staff to study modern sewer technology options while Anderson performed phase I design of the gravity sewer plan.  In its first paragraph, the agreement states that the Town "intends to construct a [gravity] sewer."  Also,


 


2) That since June 2003, staff stated that $100,000 was its estimated engineering budget to construct the TCB gravity sewer, but concealed this 90-page engineering agreement, which contained a detailed, realistic such budget of $437,850 for engineering services associated with phase I sewer construction.


 


I await your reply concerning the four numbered questions in my email of April 12, below, and again call your attention to the second point below.  I appreciate receiving a copy of this agreement on April 6 from the Town attorney.  - David


 


-----Original Message-----�From: Gary Huff [mailto:GHuff@blacksburg.gov]�Sent: Tuesday, April 13, 2004 10:20 AM�To: David Scheim�Cc: Kathleen Dooley; Adele Schirmer; tsherman@vt.edu; Al Leighton (Al Leighton); Frances Parsons (Frances Parsons); J. B. Jones Jr. (JB Jones); Joyce Lewis (Joyce Lewis); Roger Hedgepeth (Roger Hedgepeth); Ron Rordam (Ron Rordam)�Subject: RE: contracts for engineering support for TCB sewer construction


David:


 


The 1999 Agreement with Anderson & Associates signed by me was authorized by Town Council along with approval for the Phase I Design.  There are no financial or contractual commitments associated with the agreement until a purchase order for work is issued.  No other purchase orders have been issued other than those identified by staff.


 


Sorry, but you will need to pay for the FOIA request expenses unless you request and receive a waiver from Town Council.


 


Gary A. Huff


Town Manager


Town of Blacksburg


 


ghuff@blacksburg.gov


540-961-1130


www.blacksburg.gov


 


Blacksburg...The Most Exciting Town in Virginia








From: David Scheim [davids@naxs.net]�Sent: Monday, April 12, 2004 10:52 AM�To: Gary Huff�Cc: Town Council; Ken Anderson; Adele Schirmer; Meredith Tremel; Susan Kaiser; KDooley@blacksburg.gov; MVerniel@blacksburg.gov; . . . .�Subject: RE: contracts for engineering support for TCB sewer construction�


Gary,


 


I’m afraid that staff’s evasions and delays in answering simple questions about the sewer engineering budget, asked eight times by three citizens since March 9, are troubling in light of a document I finally received last week.


 


On May 21, 1999, ten days after Blacksburg Town Council voted to ask Town staff to study decentralized options for the Toms Creek Basin while Anderson and Associates performed phase I design, you signed a $983,389 agreement with Anderson and Associates for engineering services to construct 8.3 miles (phase I) of the gravity sewer plan.  This agreement stipulated that the Town intended to construct this conventional gravity sewer, making a mockery of Council’s vote asking staff to study decentralized options.


 


This 90-page legal agreement, containing nine legal addendums and precise payment terms, authorized $545,539 in fees for phase I design, which Council approved on May 11, 1999, plus an additional $437,850 for engineering work during the bidding, construction and post-construction phases.  


 


Town staff has insisted since last June, however, to citizens, Council, and DEQ, under repeated questioning, that it objectively studied all options, and that the engineering budget for this sewer project was only $100,000, for “supplemental inspections.”  In fact, this post-design engineering budget had been precisely specified as $437,850 in 87 line items in the Town’s standing legal agreement with Anderson and Associates.  Recent Town documents confirm that Anderson is indeed the sewer project engineer, will be performing, and has already begun performing precisely the extensive and complex construction and other post-design tasks specified in this 1999 agreement.  (For example, Anderson is performing and billing the Town for precisely the five tasks specified for the "bidding phase" in this agreement.)


 


On July 29, 2003, Mayor Hedgepeth had in fact indicated that staff’s $11.5 million sewer budget, providing only $100,000 for engineering, was “not truthful,” while $16 million, allowing for the actual $437,850 engineering budget and many other omitted costs, “was probably a more accurate number.”


 


It is unconscionable that staff’s unrealistically low engineering budget of $100,000 was stated to Town Council, citizens and DEQ since June 2003, but that this agreement specifying an actual post-design engineering budget of $437,850 was not revealed.  It is unacceptable that only on April 5th, after eight additional queries by three citizens on and after March 9th, and after the maximum delay of 14 working days permitted under the Freedom of Information Act, did Town staff finally release this agreement.  Given my initial question to you, below, on March 10th, I'm not sure whether staff did actually comply with FOIA requirements.


 


The belated disclosure of this agreement raises several serious questions:


 


1) With construction costs bid at $7.56 million, plus $100,000 in easement costs, $437,850 in post-design engineering costs (all but $17,000 has been spent from Anderson’s $545,000 phase I design contract), and additional bond placement costs, how can the Town complete phase I within the allocated $7.6 million budget?


 


2) Asked in a memo from DEQ engineer Dan Scott about the unusually low construction inspection budget for the sewer, on February 18, 2004, the Town stated to DEQ: 


 


“The original PER [1998 Preliminary Engineering Report] assumed that the Town would contract with a private consultant to perform the needed inspection during the construction process.  This cost was estimated in the PER at 8% of the estimated construction costs.  Since the PER, however, the Town has decided to perform the construction inspection using Town Staff.  In addition, the Town has currently budgeted $100,000 for supplemental inspection by a private consultant to be used if needed.”


 


But the Town’s 1999 engineering agreement specified that the Town would pay $299,624 to Anderson and Associates for construction inspection.  Recent Town documents confirm that Anderson, the project engineer, will perform these tasks (see www.tcbsewer.org).  Indeed, the few engineers on Town staff, overloaded with other tasks, never had either the time or specialized training to perform such work.  In view of staff's concealment of this May 21 agreement during the 2003 sewer decision process and evasions and delays in replying to repeated questions about engineering costs, I would frankly be skeptical as to any new explanation that might be offered contrary to facts noted above.


 


I expect that neither you nor Ken Anderson will allow any sewer contract to be signed before this questionable representation to DEQ is closely investigated, lest it be otherwise inferred that either of you knowingly supported this representation.  Note that a DEQ permit based upon a statement found knowingly deceptive could be retroactively voided, with other potentially serious consequences.


 


3) In its February 10, 2004 submission to DEQ, why did Town staff multiply 50-year Operation and maintenance costs for the bypass plus STEP option by 5.7 times versus the standard accounting calculation (the correct value was 29% of capital cost; staff's value was 167% of capital cost, based upon the same year-by-year figures determined by staff and provided to DEQ).


 


4) After Town Council voted on May 11, 1999 to ask staff to study decentralized sewer options, did you subsequently obtain any authorization from Council to sign this May 21 agreement with Anderson and Associates to construct the gravity sewer plan, contrary to Council’s request?  Did staff ever notify Council or citizens about this agreement?


 


I respectfully ask you to investigate these questions and cost discrepancies before signing any sewer contracts. Note that on April 9, when Circuit Court judge Robert Turk asked the Town’s legal counsel, William Broaddus, “Tell me about why the Town has to enter the [sewer] contracts pending this outcome of the challenge to the bond issue [a 30-60 day process], Broaddus conceded, “I’m not representing to the court that we would lose the opportunity to have favorable bids accepted.”


 


A proper cost accounting shows that the gravity sewer plan would cost double the bypass plus STEP sewer option, which provides identical sewer service.  The May 21, 1999 engineering agreement shows that Town staff misrepresented costs, and had planned all along to build the gravity sewer even as Council had directed it to study decentralized options.  It is furthermore not legitimate for a lame duck 4-3 Council majority to sign a sewer contract before the upcoming May 4th Town Council election for the purpose of thwarting the expressed electoral will of Blacksburg citizens.


 


Finally, Gary, does staff seriously intend to bill me for $208.16 for helping the Town belatedly expose this outrageous cover-up of sewer engineering costs?  Will staff take another 30 days to answer the questions above, or will you try to answer them promptly, before any sewer contract is authorized?  Thank you.  - David





-----Original Message-----�From: Gary Huff [mailto:GHuff@blacksburg.gov]�Sent: Tuesday, March 30, 2004 10:41 AM�To: David Scheim�Cc: Town Council�Subject: RE: contracts for engineering support for TCB sewer construction��David:��Again, staff will comply with any FOIA request for public documents that�anyone submits.  It does take some time for a staff member to gather all�the information that has been requested.��I am confident that the town has complied with and met all legal and/or�procurement requirements regarding the many annual town projects and�activities.��Gary A. Huff�Town Manager�Town of Blacksburg��ghuff@blacksburg.gov�540-961-1130�www.blacksburg.gov��Blacksburg...The Most Exciting Town in Virginia���-----Original Message-----�From: David Scheim [mailto:davids@naxs.net]�Sent: Tuesday, March 30, 2004 10:21 AM�To: Gary Huff�Cc: Town Council; Kathleen Dooley; Susan Kaiser . . . .�Subject: Re: contracts for engineering support for TCB sewer construction��Gary,��I would expect that it is the Town's goal to follow the law with respect�to spending money for purposes authorized and appropriated, and that it�shouldn't take legal efforts by citizens to support that goal.  It also�shouldn't take more than three weeks to answer simple questions asked by�myself and others since March 9 such as how much money has already been�spent on Anderson's $545,539 phase I design contract, and how much will�be spent on what contracts to pay for Anderson's stated major on-the-job�engineering role in sewer construction. ��Last May, staff presented a sewer budget with every cent of the�Engineering and related budget stripped out.  That category was 25% of�the sewer budget in 1998.  Ten percent for on-the-job engineering and�inspection is the bare minimum required to build this project.��When caught by citizens on June 10th with this engineering budget�completely stripped out, instead of admitting an oversight, staff added�back only 1%, for "supplemental inspections", on June 17th.��Now, when construction is about to start and this engineering work needs�to be done, I am afraid we're seeing that this budget, as the Mayor�indicated on July 29, is indeed "not truthful." ��Blacksburg told DEQ on February 18th that construction inspection, one�of the engineer's tasks (budgeted 8% in 1998), would be done by Town�staff, with a 1% budget for "supplemental inspections."  But then you�told me and the Director of Planning and Engineering told the Roanoke�Times this month that engineering work beyond 1% would be paid to�Anderson and Associates from an existing $545,539 phase I design�contract, and maybe from a phase II design contract.  And this work is�substantial--not just contract administration (budgeted 3% in 1998, 0%�in 2004), but on-the-job engineering.  Town documents state that�Anderson and Associates is the Project Engineer and one document�includes more than 300 references to Anderson's major and complex role�in project construction.��Thus, in May 2003 the engineering budget was 0%.  In June 2003, caught�with this category stripped, it was increased to 1%.  In February 2003,�Blacksburg told DEQ no problem, Blacksburg staff will do engineering�work needed for sewer construction beyond 1%.  This month, we're being�told no problem, Anderson will do the construction engineering using�phase I and possibly phase II design contracts, but you can't tell me�the details now because it might get the Town into legal trouble. ��I am afraid what staff told the Roanoke Times last week, that the 1998�sewer budget, including a standard 25% for engineering and related�costs, stated in an application for state and federal money, was a loose�estimate, while the 2004 budget, with every cent of engineering and�related costs stripped out and then 1% added back in is a more refined�estimate, is not credible.��In summary, a lame duck 4-3 Council majority is still pursuing a sewer�project, and trying to push it forward before Blacksburg's upcoming May�4 Council election.  This project was justified by stripping millions of�dollars from the project budget and then by multiplying operation and�maintenance costs by 5.7 times versus the standard accounting�calculation for the competing option. ��I believe it should be the role of Town staff now to provide accurate�cost information about this project and follow the law rather than�assist the above endeavor by any possible means.  I believe that Town�Council and citizens deserve timely answers to my questions of my prior�email, below.  Thank you.  - David��-----Original Message-----�From: Gary Huff [mailto:GHuff@blacksburg.gov]�Sent: Monday, March 29, 2004 8:55 AM�To: davids@naxs.net�Cc: Susan Kaiser; Meredith Tremel; Adele Schirmer; Town Council�Subject: RE: contracts for engineering support for TCB sewer construction���David:��I and town staff will be happy to comply with providing documents that�qualify under the Freedom of Information Act, however, since you have�indicated that you intend to bring litigation against the town, I am not�inclined to answer questions such as those you submitted below.��Gary A. Huff�Town Manager�Town of Blacksburg��ghuff@blacksburg.gov�540-961-1130�www.blacksburg.gov��Blacksburg...The Most Exciting Town in Virginia���-----Original Message-----�From: David Scheim [mailto:dscheim@nei.nih.gov]�Sent: Friday, March 26, 2004 12:27 PM�To: Gary Huff�Cc: Susan Kaiser; Meredith Tremel; Ken Anderson; Adele Schirmer; Town�Council; Mike Gangloff�Subject: RE: contracts for engineering support for TCB sewer construction��Gary -��I'm confused by the most recent cost information on the sewer project.��The Town applied for a VRLF loan in 1998, seeking state and federal�money, stating a phase I sewer budget of $10,841,000.  This exactly�matched the budget Blacksburg itemized in 1998 to DEQ, which included�25% engineering and related costs.��But in 2004, Town staff stated a phase I sewer budget of $7.25 million�to DEQ and for funding.  This included a 1% budget for engineering and�related costs.  It actually started out at 0% in May 2003, and 1% was�added by staff only when citizens pointed out that all these costs had�been removed.��The Town made its sewer decision based on the much lower 2003-2004 cost�estimates, even though the Mayor stated on July 29 that full project�budget consistent with those figures was "not truthful" while the higher�estimate was "probably a more accurate number."  Also, 10% is a minimum�acceptable budget for for on-the-job engineering and inspection for this�kind of project.��In your reply to me below, and in the Roanoke Times, March 24th, staff�has confirmed that my assertions are correct that Anderson and�Associates will be the Project Engineer and that there will be�substantial construction engineering and contract administration costs�associated with the project.  But you have said this isn't a problem�because this work will be funded from an existing $545,539 purchase�order to Anderson for phase I design, and possibly later from a phase II�design contract of $250,000.  I would like to ask these follow-up�questions:��1) Is it proper to make a sewer decision based on a 1% engineering and�related budget when the costs are actually much higher, even if these�costs will be paid in part out of an existing phase I design contract?��2) Is it proper to fund construction engineering and contract�administration from contracts for phase I and phase II design?  And why�will it take the Town seven more working days to answer a question I�first asked a Town employee last Friday, which is how much money has�been spent to date on Anderson's $545,539 phase I design contract?  My�other question, still not answered, is when was this money appropriated�for these new purposes, as required by state code 15.2-2506?��3) Subtracting $587,105 as budgeted for two deleted lines and $550,000�in phase I design costs from the 1998 phase I project budget of�$10,841,000 still leaves a $2.5 million discrepancy compared with the�2004 phase I sewer budget of $7.25 million.  Is the 1998 figure, used to�apply for state and federal funding, with a customary 25% budget for�engineering and related costs, really just a loose estimate that was�refined by stripping out the engineering costs?��4) In reply to a DEQ directive to "please provide a rationale for the�budgeted construction inspection costs," which were 8% in 1998 but 1% in�2004, the Town told DEQ on February 18th that "the Town has decided to�perform the construction inspection using Town Staff.  In addition, the�Town has currently budgeted $100,000 for supplemental inspection" (1% of�the project budget; 2-18-2004 PER, p. 3).  This is not consistent with�more recent statements by Town staff, noted above, that Anderson is the�project engineer and that funds for their construction-related work will�be drawn from sewer design contracts.��5) Finally, why did the Director of Planning and Engineering tell County�supervisors on February 23rd that US 460 bypass plus STEP O&M costs�would be "outrageously expensive."  According to the Town's own figures,�as stated to DEQ on February 10th (PER, Appendix B), the capital cost of�the bypass plus STEP option is $6.9 million.  According to the Town's�own figures, by standard accounting, the 50-year operation and�maintenance cost for that option is 29% of capital cost.  According to�the Town's calculation method, never used to compare projects, this�50-year O&M cost is 167% of capital cost.  That's 5.7 times the correct�figure.  A respected VT economics professor told Town Council on October�14th that anyone who used that invalid calculation method in industry�"would be fired."  Why is Town staff still using that discredited�figure? ��Thanks in advance for your reply to these additional questions.  - David��-----Original Message-----�From: Gary Huff [mailto:GHuff@blacksburg.gov]�Sent: Monday, March 15, 2004 10:02 AM�To: David Scheim�Cc: Susan Kaiser; Meredith Tremel; Ken Anderson; Adele Schirmer; Town�Council�Subject: RE: contracts for engineering support for TCB sewer construction��David:��The only contract the town has entered into with regard to the Toms�Creek sewer project is with Anderson & Associates for Phase I design.�Currently the town has no contracts in place for other services related�to this project.  We do anticipate contracting with Anderson &�Associates for the inspection of the pump station since that firm�designed the pump station.  Otherwise, it is premature to predict all�the contract services that may be needed.��We have budgeted $100,000 for inspections in Phase I.  These funds are�anticipated to supplement town staff inspections by possibly hiring a�temporary inspector to work for the town if needed.  Since we do not�know whether the construction contract will be awarded to one or more�contractors, it is not possible to exactly project the inspection�requirements that may be needed.  However, we have $250,000 budgeted in�bond proceeds which could be used for Phase II design or to supplement�inspections further should the need arise. ��Gary A. Huff�Town Manager�Town of Blacksburg��ghuff@blacksburg.gov�540-961-1130�www.blacksburg.gov��Blacksburg...The Most Exciting Town in Virginia���-----Original Message-----�From: David Scheim [mailto:davids@naxs.net]�Sent: Wednesday, March 10, 2004 11:06 AM�To: Town Council; Gary Huff�Cc: Mike Gangloff; Susan Kaiser; Meredith Tremel; Ken Anderson; Adele�Schirmer�Subject: contracts for engineering support for TCB sewer construction��Gary,��Blacksburg has been explicit in recent filings to DEQ and other�statements that the only money it has authorized for engineering,�inspection, contract administration and surveying for construction of�the TCB sewer project will be $100,000 for supplemental inspections.  It�was also noted that $250,000 for phase II design was included in funds�allocated in ordinance #1357.��I would like to ask you what contracts Blacksburg has in place or will�enter into with Anderson and Associates or any other engineering firm�for work related to the TCB sewer project, and what are the budgeted or�anticipated amounts of these contracts.  I would also like to ask�whether any contracts or payments to other parties who in turn would�contract for such engineering work related to TCB sewer construction�have been or would be made by Blacksburg.��I regret that you and Anderson and Associates are in the middle of this,�but I feel it would be a very serious matter if planned costs for the�TCB sewer project were significantly higher than those stated to Council�and citizens and designated in ordinance #1357.  This would be counter�to my deepest principles and also to the Town's standards of integrity.��- David�----------------------�David E. Scheim, Ph.D.�3300 Old Farm Road�Blacksburg, VA 24060�540 552-8014  davids@naxs.net


